Bid # 7008-012016-1

Title: Six (6) Half Ton Pickup Trucks

Date: 01/20/2016

Time: 2:00 PM
Bid Tabulation: Preliminary Vendor A Vendor B Vendor C Vendor D
Woody Anderson Ford Adamson Ford Long Leév;lsozlc; Tl ine Stivers Ford Lincoln
Item #| Qty |Description Unit Price Total Price Bid Price Total Price Bid Price Total Price Bid Price Total Price
Half Ton Pickup
1 5 | Truck - Option A | $ 23,067.00 | $115,335.00 | $ 24,994.86 | $124,974.30 [ $ 22,605.50 | $113,027.50 | $ 22,750.17 | $113,750.85
Make/Model 2016 Ford F150 2016 Ford F150 Ford F-150 Ford F-150
Delivery Time 10 weeks 8-12 weeks 10-12 weeks 10-12 weeks
Half Ton Pickup
1 1 | Truck - OptionB [ $ 23,335.00 | $ 23,335.00 | $ 25,262.86 | $ 25,262.86 | $ 22,855.50 | $ 22,855.50 | $ 23,156.32 | $ 23,156.32
Make/Model 2016 Ford F150 2016 Ford F150 Ford F-150 Ford F-150
Delivery Time 10 weeks 8-12 weeks 10-12 weeks 10-12 weeks
Bid Tabulation: Preliminary Vendor E Vendor F Vendor G Vendor H
, Tuscaloosa Chevrolet (Local Townsend Ford (Local
Barkley GMC (Local Bidder) Bidder) Landers McLarty Dodge Bidder)
Item #| Qty |Description Unit Price Total Price Bid Price Total Price Bid Price Total Price Bid Price Total Price
Half Ton Pickup
1 5 | Truck - Option A | $ 24,093.36 | $120,466.80 | $ 23,776.50 | $118,882.50 | $ 21,285.00 | $106,425.00 [ $ 22,310.36 | $111,551.80
Make/Model GMC Sierra 2016 Cheuvrolet Silverado Ram 1500 Ford F-150
Delivery Time 6-8 weeks 15-16 weeks 6-8 weeks 6-8 weeks
Half Ton Pickup
1 1 | Truck - Option B | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 21,285.00 [ $ 21,285.00 [ $ 22,578.36 | $ 22,578.36
Ram 1500 (No gas prep
Make/Model package) Ford F-150
Delivery Time 6-8 weeks 6-8 weeks

Local Bidders receive 5% local bidder preference in accordance with State of Alabama Bid Law

City of Tuscaloosa
Purchasing Department

Page 1 of 1



